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Readers young and old will be delighted to discover the wonders of Washington State, from its natural
beauty (Mount Rainier and evergreen forests), to its famous residents (Jimi Hendrix and Big Foot) and
familiar skyline (Seattle's Space Needle). Intriguing facts coupled with beautiful, original artwork make E is
for Evergreen an exciting journey.Marie and Roland Smith grew up in Oregon and live on a small farm south
of Portland. Roland is the author of many award-winning books for children including Thunder Cave,
Sasquatch, Jaguar, Zach's Lie, and The Captain's Dog: My Journey with the Lewis and Clark Tribe, which
won the Pacific Northwest Bookseller's Award. Marie and Roland also collaborated on B is for Beaver: An
Oregon Alphabet, published in 2003. A professional artist since she graduated from The Art Center College
of Design in California, Linda Holt Ayriss also holds a BFA from Pacific Lutheran University, WA. She is
the recipient of a silver medal from the Best in the West Society of Illustrators, and has been recognized in
the "Communication Arts" Annual. Linda has taught at Cal State Northridge and is currently mentoring two
students in her studio. She lives on Bainbridge Island, Washington, just across Puget Sound from Seattle.
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From reader reviews:

Trisha Sherman:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled E is for
Evergreen: A Washington State Alphabet (Discover America State by State)? Maybe it is to get best activity
for you. You understand beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than
before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have different opinion?

Angela Drew:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each information they get. How people
have to be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book.
Reading through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this E is for Evergreen:
A Washington State Alphabet (Discover America State by State) book because this book offers you rich info
and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you
know.

Teresa Laureano:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the name E is for Evergreen: A
Washington State Alphabet (Discover America State by State) suitable to you? Often the book was written
by renowned writer in this era. The particular book untitled E is for Evergreen: A Washington State Alphabet
(Discover America State by State)is the main of several books that everyone read now. This book was
inspired many people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of measuring
that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their plan in the simple way, consequently all of people
can easily to comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information about this
world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this book.

Elizabeth Maez:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This E is for Evergreen: A Washington State
Alphabet (Discover America State by State) can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know.
You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not
a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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