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The timeless wisdom of an American legend

"There has never been a finer man in American sports than John Wooden, or a finer coach."
—Sports Illustrated

2 eBooks in 1!

One of the greatest coaches in sports history, John Wooden is as treasured for his personal philosophy as he
is for his remarkable achievements on the basketball court.

This exclusive two-eBook set showcases the legendary coach’s distinctive views on leadership, values,
family, and the true meaning of success. Containing personal reminiscences from sports luminaries and
many never-before-seen photos, Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images celebrates a man who achieved so
much and helped so many by living a life founded on simple truths.

This two-eBook set includes:

Wooden

In this national bestseller, John Wooden shares his personal philosophy on family, achievement, success, and
excellence. Raised on a small farm in south-central Indiana, he offers lessons and wisdom learned throughout
his career at UCLA and life as a dedicated husband, father, and teacher.

These lessons, along with personal letters from Bill Walton, Denny Crum, Kareem Abdul-Jabbar, and Bob
Costas, among others, have made Wooden: A Lifetime of Observations and Reflections on and off the Court
an inspirational classic.

The Wisdom of Wooden

John Wooden wrote his final book in the last months before his death. Filled with his most treasured
memories and more than 100 photographs, many never before published, The Wisdom of Wooden: My
Century On and Off the Court, captures a life spent serving others. Ultimately it was the life he lived that
served as a model for his greatest lesson of all: a deep commitment to family, friends, and faith—the bedrock
values of the man we all called, “Coach.”

“The Wisdom of Wooden has given me the life that I have . . . Thanks, Coach, for your faith and patience.”
—Bill Walton

“The Wisdom of Wooden is a lifetime of Coach Wooden’s ideas on how to live life without sacrificing your
moral principles. His life is a prime example of how this can be done—one that we can all learn from.”
—Kareem Abdul-Jabbar
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From reader reviews:

Vincent Overly:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK). Try to make book
Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend
when you truly feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the
book. So , let us make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Rose Ibarra:

This Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information
inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This kind of Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) without we
comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry
Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) can bring whenever you are and not make your bag
space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This
Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) having excellent arrangement in word and also layout,
so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Kristen Wright:

The particular book Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) has a lot of knowledge on it. So
when you check out this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous
author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you
can find the point easily after reading this book.

Judi Orta:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. That book Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images (EBOOK) was
vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Wooden: A Legacy in Words and Images
(EBOOK) has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator
Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you
bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to
like reading in which.
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