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Have you ever met a child who talked like an adult? Who knew big words and how to use them? Was he a
charmer or an insufferable smart aleck—or maybe both? Mark Oppenheimer was just such a boy, his talent
for language a curse as much as a blessing. But when he got to junior high, Oppenheimer discovered an
outlet for his loquaciousness: the debate team. Frank and comical, Wisenheimer chronicles the travails of a
hyperarticulate child who finds salvation in the heady world of competitive oratory.

In stirring prose, Oppenheimer describes what it was like to have a gift with no useful application. Unlike
math or music prodigies, he had no way to showcase his unique skill, except to speak like a miniature
adult—a trick some found impressive but others found irritating. Frustrated and isolated, Oppenheimer used
his powers for ill—he became a wisenheimer, pushing his peers and teachers away. Then, in junior high, he
discovered the world he was meant for: the debate club. His skill with language was finally being channeled,
refined, and honed into something beautiful.

As Oppenheimer blossomed as a person, he also became a world-champion high school and college debater.
His journey from loneliness to fulfillment affords a fascinating inside look at the extraordinary subculture of
world-class high school debate and at the power of language to change one’s life.

Oppenheimer writes movingly about the art of rhetoric, of his passion for it, and of the inspiration he derived
from debating and watching others do it. This smart, funny memoir not only reveals a strange, compelling
subculture, it also offers a broader discussion of the splendor and power of language and of the social and
developmental hazards of being a gifted child. Finally, it looks with hope at our present age, in which oratory
is once again an important force in American culture.

Revealing, touching, and entertaining, Wisenheimer offers a brilliant portrait of the rarefied world of high
school and college debate—and of what it’s like to grow up talkative in America.
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From reader reviews:

John Masterson:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a stroll, shopping,
or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled Wisenheimer: A Childhood
Subject to Debate? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time
with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have
additional opinion?

Roy Stoudt:

This Wisenheimer: A Childhood Subject to Debate are usually reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The main reason of this Wisenheimer: A Childhood Subject to Debate can be one of
many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with
information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this
Wisenheimer: A Childhood Subject to Debate giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it
and revel in reading.

Tiffany Hernandez:

Often the book Wisenheimer: A Childhood Subject to Debate has a lot associated with on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author.
Tom makes some research before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after scanning this book.

Quincy Nelson:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you go
through a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to
the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Wisenheimer: A Childhood Subject to Debate provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.
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