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When this deal breaks, Heaven will fall.

Heaven Corp, Book 1

Catching two demon burglars is routine for Gabriel 1089, who’s one cog in an army of cybernetically
modified humans protecting the sky city of Heaven. Until two turns into a twenty-demon ambush. When he
wakes up, he’s missing his network-enabled halo—and one of his metal wings.

The down-level junk dealer tending Gabe’s wounds has hands that spark nerve endings he never knew he
possessed. But for an angel cut off from Heaven, an attic in Old Trent feels more like a trap than a sanctuary.

Demons on his doorstep are nothing new for Jeff Werth. Ever since they saved his daughter’s legs, they’ve
been calling in their marker. In exchange for his services—nursing Gabe back to health so they can use him
as a pawn in their war with Heaven—they’ll consider the debt paid in full. Except having a powerless angel
at his mercy feeds a rising desire that has him rethinking the deal.

Then the de-haloed Gabe begins having dreams that become visions…then memories. Until he’s not sure
whose side he’s on. Heaven, or the simple family man who healed his broken wings…and made his heart
whole.

Warning: The sexual awakening of an angel, some wing porn, abuse of heavenly clichés and a dog who
steals the show.
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From reader reviews:

Joyce Coolidge:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive currently, people have do
something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is
high. In your case who want to start reading any book, we give you that Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) book as
nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Manuel Thomas:

The ability that you get from Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) could be the more deep you digging the
information that hide within the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to understand but Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) giving you thrill feeling of reading. The copy
writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because
the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase
well. That makes it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) instantly.

Pierre Taylor:

This Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) tend to be reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why.
The main reason of this Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) can be on the list of great books you must have is giving
you more than just simple reading through food but feed you actually with information that probably will
shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and
whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp)
forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical
thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Ernestine Pagan:

Many people said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Angel: 1089 (Heaven Corp) to make your personal
reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you such as reading. Try to
choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and studying especially.
It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a book and examine it. Beside that the guide Angel: 1089
(Heaven Corp) can to be your brand new friend when you're feel alone and confuse in doing what must
you're doing of that time.
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