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This book presents the elements of everyday Portuguese, stressing European Portuguese, but also giving
information on Brazilian Portuguese. Covering grammatical topics, vocabulary, and practice sentence
material, this book is a solid, well-organized approach to Portuguese that anyone interested in the language
will find highly useful.
Pronunciation is very clearly explained first, and it is followed by twenty-five well-proportioned, progressive
lessons that cover all the main points of contemporary grammar: gender, present indicative, formation of
plural, agreement and position of adjectives, definite and indefinite article, use of ser and estar, commands,
personal pronouns, imperfect indicative, reflexive pronouns and reflexive verbs, present subjunctive, future
and imperfect subjunctive, conditional, negatives, infinitive, pluperfect and perfect indicative, and much
more. An Appendix gives conjugations of regular verbs, orthographic-changing verbs, radical-changing
verbs, and irregular verbs, while a Portuguese-English Vocabulary, an English-Portuguese Vocabulary, and
an Index complete the book.
This book is suitable for self-study outside of class, for refresher, and for reference. It is particularly useful as
a supplement to phrase and conversational study.
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From reader reviews:

Katherine Belcher:

Typically the book Introduction to Portuguese Grammar (Dover Language Guides) will bring you to
definitely the new experience of reading any book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In
case you try to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Introduction to
Portuguese Grammar (Dover Language Guides) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the
e-book through the official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

David Lucero:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the data
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
children, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One of them is this
Introduction to Portuguese Grammar (Dover Language Guides).

William Johnson:

Introduction to Portuguese Grammar (Dover Language Guides) can be one of your beginner books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information.
The article writer giving his/her effort to put every word into delight arrangement in writing Introduction to
Portuguese Grammar (Dover Language Guides) however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the
hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be among it. This great information can
easily drawn you into brand new stage of crucial contemplating.

Brooke Gafford:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Introduction to Portuguese Grammar (Dover
Language Guides) can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these books
have than the others?
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