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Media Kit

Play Me Something Quick and Devilish explores the heritage of traditional fiddle music in Missouri. Howard
Wight Marshall considers the place of homemade music in people’s lives across social and ethnic
communities from the late 1700s to the World War I years and into the early 1920s. This exceptionally
important and complex period provided the foundations in history and settlement for the evolution of today’s
old-time fiddling.

Beginning with the French villages on the Mississippi River, Marshall leads us chronologically through the
settlement of the state and how these communities established our cultural heritage. Other core populations
include the “Old Stock Americans” (primarily Scotch-Irish from Kentucky, Tennessee, North Carolina, and
Virginia), African Americans, German-speaking immigrants, people with American Indian ancestry
(focusing on Cherokee families dating from the Trail of Tears in the 1830s), and Irish railroad workers in the
post–Civil War period. These are the primary communities whose fiddle and dance traditions came together
on the Missouri frontier to cultivate the bounty of old-time fiddling enjoyed today.

Marshall also investigates themes in the continuing evolution of fiddle traditions. These themes include the
use of the violin in Westward migration, in the Civil War years, and in the railroad boom that changed
history. Of course, musical tastes shift over time, and the rise of music literacy in the late Victorian period, as
evidenced by the brass band movement and immigrant music teachers in small towns, affected fiddling. The
contributions of music publishing as well as the surprising importance of ragtime and early jazz also had
profound effects. Much of the old-time fiddlers’ repertory arises not from the inherited reels, jigs, and
hornpipes from the British Isles, nor from the waltzes, schottisches, and polkas from the Continent, but from
the prolific pens of Tin Pan Alley.

Marshall also examines regional styles in Missouri fiddling and comments on the future of this time-
honored, and changing, tradition. Documentary in nature, this social history draws on various academic
disciplines and oral histories recorded in Marshall’s forty-some years of research and field experience.
Historians, music aficionados, and lay people interested in Missouri folk heritage—as well as fiddlers, of
course—will find Play Me Something Quick and Devilish an entertaining and enlightening read.

With 39 tunes, the enclosed Voyager Records companion CD includes a historic sampler of Missouri fiddlers
and styles from 1955 to 2012.
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From reader reviews:

Nicholas Walsh:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you
want something to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy individual? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question
mainly because just their can do which. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
suitable. Because start from on pre-school until university need that Play Me Something Quick and Devilish:
Old-Time Fiddlers in Missouri to read.

Helen Johnson:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get great
deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will
say absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is definitely Play Me Something Quick and Devilish: Old-Time Fiddlers in Missouri.

Donald Labelle:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Play Me Something Quick and
Devilish: Old-Time Fiddlers in Missouri, it is possible to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still
would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still
don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Marcus Huskins:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and Play Me Something Quick and Devilish:
Old-Time Fiddlers in Missouri or others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or perhaps
students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside
science reserve, any other book likes Play Me Something Quick and Devilish: Old-Time Fiddlers in Missouri
to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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