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“…It is the price you pay for choosing to be a cop. Your brother’s life…”

Those words haunt her dreams, and her waking moments. LAPD officer, Aurora Kavvan cannot rest until
she finds her brothers killer. Digging into the past always brings back unpleasant things: memories,
guilt…the hit man. Now she is in a race against time to find the murderer before he finds her.

“Kill her. I don’t care how, and I don’t care where, but I want her dead now!”

Someone was trying to kill his dead partner’s sister. FBI agent, Jordan Reiley will stop at nothing to protect
the woman he loves. Even if it means going against her wishes; putting himself between her and the man
who murdered her brother.

Will God keep them alive long enough for them to find the truth?
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From reader reviews:

Tim Travers:

What do you about book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They have to answer that question
since just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Shadows from the Past to
read.

Gary Sandler:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or their
very own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to
fill your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost time/
holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the reserve untitled Shadows from the Past can be great book to read. May be it could
be best activity to you.

Vincent Mireles:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Shadows from the Past can be
the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?

Santiago Klein:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need
to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the books in the
top listing in your reading list is Shadows from the Past. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry
Slopes can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and review this reserve you can get
many advantages.
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