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Eight years after Alpha was exposed to her first and only addictive, encoded musical track from the Corp,
she finds that she cannot run away from the haunting dreams or desire to taste the emotional high again. At
seventeen, she has left the temptations of the Web for a fresh start in Los Angeles, where she has formed a
band of her own. But it only takes one urgent call to bring Alpha back home and to her brother Anthem’s
side.

Addiction to encoded tracks is down and an elected government reigns, but somehow more and more people
are starting to look like they did in the old days, sickly and addicted. Alpha and her friends will have to dig
deeper into the mainframe than ever before in order to reverse the effects before it is too late. Alpha is
thrilled to be reunited once again with her twin, Omega, but his connection with her may be more of a dual-
edged sword than a doubling of forces.

Emma Trevayne’s sequel to Coda concludes the series with a crescendo of unexpected twists, hard-earned
triumphs, and agonizing decisions—all coming together as a symphony of pure emotion.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Jones:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide Chorus will make you to possibly
be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think that
will open or reading a new book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they may be thought like that?
Have you in search of best book or suited book with you?

Julia Flowers:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
any time those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource
then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take Chorus as your daily resource information.

Linda Wood:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book specially book entitled
Chorus the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unknown for
but surely will end up your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become
one contact form conclusion and explanation that will maybe you never get before. The Chorus giving you
another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful information for your
better life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind
will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Dan Morris:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Chorus which is having the e-
book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's find.
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