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This book offers a systematic examination, analysis and evaluation of Israeli national security statecraft in
terms of challenges and responses.

Providing an in-depth analysis of Israeli statecraft challenges and responses, this interdisciplinary book
integrates social science and security studies with public policy approaches within a long-term historical
perspective on the Arab-Israeli conflict. These scholarly approaches are synthesized with extensive personal
knowledge of the author based on involvement in Israeli political-security policy making. This book makes
use of conceptualizations of statecraft such as 'fuzzy gambling' and interventions with critical mass in ultra-
dynamic historical processes to help clarify Israel's main statecraft successes and failures, alongside the
wider theoretical apparatuses these concepts represent. While focused on Israel, these theoretical frameworks
have important implications for the academic study of statecraft and statecraft praxis worldwide.

This book will be of much interest to both statecraft practitioners and to students of Israeli politics and
security, the Middle Eastern conflict, strategic studies and IR/security studies in general.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Trumbo:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or
their own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to test look for book, may be the book untitled Israeli Statecraft: National Security Challenges and
Responses (Besa Studies in International Security) can be fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to
you.

William Butcher:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your
mind ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared
to can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need more
time to be study. Israeli Statecraft: National Security Challenges and Responses (Besa Studies in
International Security) can be your answer since it can be read by a person who have those short time
problems.

Carmen Flood:

Beside this particular Israeli Statecraft: National Security Challenges and Responses (Besa Studies in
International Security) in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The
information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel
like an outdated people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Israeli Statecraft: National
Security Challenges and Responses (Besa Studies in International Security) because this book offers for you
readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you seldom get what it's exactly about. Oh come on,
that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable,
like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book along with read it from now!

Doug Campbell:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you will get it in e-book
way, more simple and reachable. This Israeli Statecraft: National Security Challenges and Responses (Besa
Studies in International Security) can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at this one
book you have factor that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This specific book
can be one of a step for you to get success. This book offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't
know, by knowing more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need
to have Israeli Statecraft: National Security Challenges and Responses (Besa Studies in International



Security).
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