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First in an all-new trilogy from long-time Dragonlance author Douglas Niles.

This title kicks off a key new Dragonlance trilogy from popular Dragonlance author Douglas Niles. This
series will explore the post-war era in Solamnia, a central region of the Dragonlance world, continuing key
story elements from the New York Times best-selling War of Souls series. 

AUTHOR BIO: Douglas Niles is the author of over 20 fantasy novels, many of which were published with
Wizards of the Coast, Inc. He is also an award-winning roleplaying game designer who was part of the
original creation team for the Dragonlance setting two decades ago. His most recent books in the
Dragonlance world include Wizards’ Conclave and the Icewall Trilogy.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Hupp:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive
currently, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice through surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading any book, we give you that Lord of the Rose: The Rise
of Solamnia, Book 1 book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just
a book.

Rudy Nixon:

Is it you who having spare time then spend it whole day simply by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Lord of the Rose: The Rise of Solamnia, Book 1 can be
the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your
free time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the
others?

Edward Crosley:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but in addition novel and Lord of the Rose: The Rise of Solamnia,
Book 1 or perhaps others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book,
you feel want to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or maybe students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In some other case, beside science publication,
any other book likes Lord of the Rose: The Rise of Solamnia, Book 1 to make your spare time much more
colorful. Many types of book like this.

Joseph Esparza:

Some people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book Lord of the Rose: The Rise of Solamnia,
Book 1 to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading proficiency is developing when you
just like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the idea about book and
studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open up a book and read it. Beside that the
guide Lord of the Rose: The Rise of Solamnia, Book 1 can to be your friend when you're feel alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of these time.
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