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Statisticians and researchers will find Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition, by Maura Stokes,
Charles Davis, and Gary Koch, to be a useful discussion of categorical data analysis techniques as well as an
invaluable aid in applying these methods with SAS. Practical examples from a broad range of applications
illustrate the use of the FREQ, LOGISTIC, GENMOD, NPAR1WAY, and CATMOD procedures in a
variety of analyses. Topics discussed include assessing association in contingency tables and sets of tables,
logistic regression and conditional logistic regression, weighted least squares modeling, repeated
measurements analyses, loglinear models, generalized estimating equations, and bioassay analysis.

The third edition updates the use of SAS/STAT software to SAS/STAT 12.1 and incorporates ODS
Graphics. Many additional SAS statements and options are employed, and graphs such as effect plots, odds
ratio plots, regression diagnostic plots, and agreement plots are discussed. The material has also been revised
and reorganized to reflect the evolution of categorical data analysis strategies. Additional techniques include
such topics as exact Poisson regression, partial proportional odds models, Newcombe confidence intervals,
incidence density ratios, and so on.
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From reader reviews:

John Bullen:

This Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book will be information
inside this publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This particular Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition without we
realize teach the one who looking at it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't always be worry
Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition can bring once you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition having very good arrangement in word and also layout,
so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

John McGinnis:

The guide with title Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition has a lot of information that you
can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new information the
information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Joan Davis:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
fine you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Categorical
Data Analysis Using SAS, Third Edition which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
view.

Amy Quist:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you could have it in
e-book means, more simple and reachable. This specific Categorical Data Analysis Using SAS, Third
Edition can give you a lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have thing that they
don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for you to
get success. This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than some other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let me have Categorical Data Analysis
Using SAS, Third Edition.
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