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Schooling for Social Change offers fresh perspectives on the emerging field of human rights education in
India. 60 years after independence, the Indian schooling system remains unequal. Building on over a year of
fieldwork, including interviews and focus groups with policymakers, educators, parents and students,
Monisha Bajaj examines different understandings of human rights education at the levels of policy,
pedagogy and practice. She provides an in-depth study of the origins and effects of the Institute of Human
Rights Education, a non-governmental program that operates in over 4,000 schools in India.

This enlightening book offers an instructive case study of how international mandates and grassroots
activism can work together.

Bajaj shows how the Institute of Human Rights Education has gained significant momentum for school-
based adoption, textbook reform, and policy changes in a nation-state still struggling to ensure universal
access to education. Schooling for Social Change provides a wealth of analysis from the frontlines of
education reform and will be of interest to all those working in international and comparative education,
human rights, and South Asian development.
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From reader reviews:

Florence Whitney:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or data even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era and that is always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which one you should start with. This Schooling for Social
Change: The Rise and Impact of Human Rights Education in India is our recommendation to cause you to
keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Penny Laughlin:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book
that will improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience happy read
one with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Typically the Schooling for Social Change: The
Rise and Impact of Human Rights Education in India is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Eddie Barber:

The reason why? Because this Schooling for Social Change: The Rise and Impact of Human Rights
Education in India is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap that but
latter it will distress you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who
all write the book in such remarkable way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining
means but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this any
more or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of gains than the other book get such as help
improving your ability and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I
ended up you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Sebrina Knapp:

Beside this specific Schooling for Social Change: The Rise and Impact of Human Rights Education in India
in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the
knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an old
people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Schooling for Social Change: The Rise and Impact of
Human Rights Education in India because this book offers for you readable information. Do you oftentimes
have book but you would not get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your
hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you
still want to miss the item? Find this book as well as read it from right now!
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