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For followers of the legendary Rams no phrase sums up the club more aptly than ‘it could only happen at
Derby County’. This hugely entertaining collection of strange but true tales shows exactly why. Through
over one thousand fascinating nuggets of trivia – humorous, tragic, strange and utterly bizarre in turn –
author and lifelong fan Peter Seddon captures the very essence of the wierd and wonderful world of the
incomparable Rams.
Discover the awful truth about the severed head found at the Baseball Ground, find out which Rams player
was immortalised in a feature film, when bad light stopped play, whose wife wrote racy novels, which Rams
striker almost wished death on the entire squad, and why ace-winger Alan Hinton was dropped after the
worst televised miss of all time.
The entertaining stories and quirky snippets in The Little Book of Derby County are sure to amuse all
football lovers, but in particular that special breed of fan who supports the redoubtable Rams through thick
and thin.
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From reader reviews:

Emmanuel Young:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book The Little Book of Derby County. You can choose the
best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book The
Little Book of Derby County. You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by a book.
Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can realize everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In
this era, we could open a book or searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when
you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's learn.

Jenni Roberts:

Here thing why that The Little Book of Derby County are different and reliable to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good however it depends in the content than it which is the content is as delicious as food
or not. The Little Book of Derby County giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find
any publication out there but there is no reserve that similar with The Little Book of Derby County. It gives
you thrill reading journey, its open up your own personal eyes about the thing this happened in the world
which is maybe can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in
your approach home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of
The Little Book of Derby County in e-book can be your alternate.

Ella Woods:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story or
perhaps their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the publications. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write to the book. One of them is
this The Little Book of Derby County.

Suzanne Robbins:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its handle may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in
the outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Little Book of Derby County why because
the amazing cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content is
actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up
this book.
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