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John Bingham was the architect of the rebirth of the United States following the Civil War. A leading
antislavery lawyer and congressman from Ohio, Bingham wrote the most important part of the Fourteenth
Amendment to the Constitution, which guarantees fundamental rights and equality to all Americans. He was
also at the center of two of the greatest trials in history, giving the closing argument in the military
prosecution of John Wilkes Booth’s co-conspirators for the assassination of Abraham Lincoln and in the
impeachment of President Andrew Johnson. And more than any other man, Bingham played the key role in
shaping the Union’s policy towards the occupied ex-Confederate States, with consequences that still haunt
our politics.
  
American Founding Son provides the most complete portrait yet of this remarkable statesman. Drawing on
his personal letters and speeches, the book traces Bingham’s life from his humble roots in Pennsylvania
through his career as a leader of the Republican Party. Gerard N. Magliocca argues that Bingham and his
congressional colleagues transformed the Constitution that the Founding Fathers created, and did so with the
same ingenuity that their forbears used to create a more perfect union in the 1780s. In this book, Magliocca
restores Bingham to his rightful place as one of our great leaders.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Anderson:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a book you will get new information due to the fact book is one of various ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how
the characters do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read this
American Founding Son: John Bingham and the Invention of the Fourteenth Amendment, it is possible to
tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make
them reading a e-book.

John Warner:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book specifically book
entitled American Founding Son: John Bingham and the Invention of the Fourteenth Amendment your
thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe mysterious for but
surely can become your mind friends. Imaging every word written in a guide then become one web form
conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get previous to. The American Founding Son: John
Bingham and the Invention of the Fourteenth Amendment giving you another experience more than blown
away your mind but also giving you useful details for your better life with this era. So now let us explain to
you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished
studying it, like winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Jacqueline Ramos:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you go through
a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what forms
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your analysis, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and soon. The American Founding Son: John Bingham and the Invention of the Fourteenth Amendment will
give you a new experience in looking at a book.

Tanya McGaha:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This American Founding Son: John Bingham and the Invention of
the Fourteenth Amendment can give you a lot of close friends because by you taking a look at this one book
you have point that they don't and make you more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one



step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have American Founding
Son: John Bingham and the Invention of the Fourteenth Amendment.
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