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On paper, praying seems easy enough. But, when we try to pray daily, we sometimes realize that it’s much
harder than we’d thought. In fact, it’s usually easier to come up with excuses not to pray than reasons to
pray. And the most common excuse seems to be the busyness of life. But a vibrant prayer life doesn’t have to
be an elusive goal; because at its core, prayer is simply talking and listening to God. Using passages from
both the Old and New Testaments, Joseph Yoo takes a look at how and why we pray, how to handle what we
perceive to be unanswered prayer, and how to learn to hear and recognize God’s voice.

Converge Bible Studies is a series of topical Bible studies. Each title in the series consists of four studies on a
common topic or theme. Converge can be used by small groups, classes, or individuals. Primary Scripture
passages from the Common English Bible are included for ease of study, as are questions designed to
encourage both personal reflection and group conversation. The topics and Scriptures in Converge come
together to transform readers’ relationships with others, themselves, and God.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Moore:

With other case, little persons like to read book Converge Bible Studies: Practical Prayer. You can choose
the best book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book
Converge Bible Studies: Practical Prayer. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world
by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country
until foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that.
In this era, we are able to open a book or even searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You should
use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Cheryl Taylor:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals to
be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Converge Bible Studies: Practical
Prayer book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Matthew Thompson:

The ability that you get from Converge Bible Studies: Practical Prayer may be the more deep you digging the
information that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book
is hard to recognise but Converge Bible Studies: Practical Prayer giving you buzz feeling of reading. The
copy writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read it
because the author of this reserve is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own vocabulary
increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We propose you for having this Converge Bible Studies: Practical Prayer instantly.

Paul Leavens:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, ya think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Converge
Bible Studies: Practical Prayer which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
view.
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