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“An absorbing and moving tale” (Publishers Weekly)—a uniquely American story of the consequences
of past decisions on present realities.

After World War II, the Needham family moved north to Philadelphia from South Carolina, leaving behind
the tragic injustice surrounding the violent death of their patriarch, King. His devoted widow, Selma, remains
on the old home place. Over the years, she raises King’s children, including his great-grandson, Rayne, on
whom falls the responsibility of bringing the family together, saving the family land, and mending the rift
with his mother.

If Sons, Then Heirs is a tour de force that explores the power of family secrets, bonds, and love. Rayne and
the other characters face challenges big and small that mirror the experiences of families everywhere. But in
the masterful storytelling of Lorene Cary, their voices are so distinct and unique that they will live in the
minds of readers long after the last page is read. 
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From reader reviews:

Ila Petty:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
you is you don't know which one you should start with. This If Sons, Then Heirs: A Novel is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and wish
in this era.

Mark Bottoms:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a
lot of information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the knowledge
about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids,
there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One of them is this If Sons, Then
Heirs: A Novel.

John James:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach,
or picnic within the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to
something different to fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book can be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to
attempt look for book, may be the reserve untitled If Sons, Then Heirs: A Novel can be fine book to read.
May be it can be best activity to you.

Crystal Lavigne:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You
can choose the most beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from
it. It is named of book If Sons, Then Heirs: A Novel. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without
departing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most
significant that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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