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Among followers of Jesus, great is often the enemy of good.

The drive to be great—to be a success by the standards of the world—often crowds out the qualities of
goodness, virtue, and faithfulness that should define the central focus of Christian leadership. In the culture
of today’s church, successful leadership is often judged by what works, while persistent faithfulness takes a
back seat. If a ministry doesn’t produce results, it is dropped. If people don’t respond, we move on. This
pursuit of “greatness” exerts a crushing pressure on the local church and creates a consuming anxiety in its
leaders. In their pursuit of this warped vision of greatness, church leaders end up embracing a leadership
narrative that runs counter to the sacrificial call of the gospel story.

When church leaders focus on faithfulness to God and the gospel, however, it’s always a kingdom-
win—regardless of the visible results of their ministry. John the Baptist modeled this kind of leadership. As
John’s disciples crossed the Jordan River to follow after Jesus, John freely released them to a greater calling
than following him. Speaking of Jesus, John said: “He must increase, but I must decrease.” Joyfully satisfied
to have been faithful to his calling, John knew that the size and scope of his ministry would be determined by
the will of the Father, not his own will. Following the example of John the Baptist and with a careful look at
the teaching of Scripture, Tim Suttle dares church leaders to risk failure by chasing the vision God has given
them—no matter how small it might seem—instead of pursuing the broad path of pragmatism that leads to
fame and numerical success.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Reavis:

The book Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth Culture give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your
spare time. You need to use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can being your best
friend when you getting tension or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make looking at a
book Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth Culture to become your habit, you can get considerably
more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You
are able to know everything if you like open up and read a publication Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-
Growth Culture. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some others. So ,
how do you think about this reserve?

Elmer Pereira:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the concept Shrink: Faithful
Ministry in a Church-Growth Culture suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth Cultureis a single of several books
in which everyone read now. That book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this
reserve you will enter the new dimension that you ever know just before. The author explained their strategy
in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a
great deal of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world on this book.

Jared Smith:

This Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth Culture is new way for you who has curiosity to look for
some information since it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you
know or else you who still having bit of digest in reading this Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth
Culture can be the light food to suit your needs because the information inside that book is easy to get simply
by anyone. These books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yes I mean in the e-book
web form. People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the answer.
So there isn't any in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for a person. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book kind for your better life and knowledge.

Anna Baron:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is created or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news.
Within this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social just like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or
just in search of the Shrink: Faithful Ministry in a Church-Growth Culture when you essential it?
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