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A wide-ranging consideration of the place of dreams and visions in Islamic societies from the pre-modern
period to the present.

Dreams and visions have always been important in Islamic societies. Yet, their pervasive impact on Muslim
communities and on the lives of individual Muslims remains largely unknown and rather surprising to
Westerners. This book addresses this gap in understanding with a fascinating and diverse account, taking
readers from premodern Islam to the present day. Dreams and visions are shown to have been, and to be,
significant in a range of social, educational, and cultural roles. The book includes a wealth of examples
detailing the Sufi experience. Contributors use Arabic, Persian, Indian, Central Asian, and Ottoman sources
and employ approaches grounded in history, sociology, psychology, anthropology, religious studies, and
literary analysis. This is an illuminating work, showing how ordinary Muslims, Muslim notables, Sufis, legal
scholars, and rulers have perceived both themselves and the world around them through the prism of dreams
and visions.

“This book provides a marvelous appreciative look at an important aspect of the art of narrative across many
facets of Muslim community life, and the endurance of that art through the centuries. The stories
communicate not only substantial elements of theological importance but a pervasive sense of the
significance of personal relationships, especially affection for the Prophet, all told with much warmth and
wit.” — John Renard, author of Islam and Christianity: Theological Themes in Comparative Perspective

Özgen Felek is a Mellon Postdoctoral Fellow in Religious Studies at Stanford University. She is coeditor
(with Walter G. Andrews) of Victoria R. Holbrook’a Arma?an..

Alexander D. Knysh is Professor of Islamic Studies at the University of Michigan. His books include Ibn
‘Arabi in the Later Islamic Tradition: The Making of a Polemical Image in Medieval Islam, also published
by SUNY Press; Islamic Mysticism: A Short History; and Islam in Historical Perspective.
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From reader reviews:

Andrew Drake:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or this for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't need
do that. You must know how great and important the book Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies. All type
of book would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Mindy Hicks:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, magazine, book,
and soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book
that recommended for your requirements is Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies this reserve consist a lot
of the information of the condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has
grown up. The words styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made
some exploration when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Karen Johnson:

Beside that Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close
to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from
your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have
Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies because this book offers for your requirements readable
information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not
happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable agreement here cannot be questionable, similar to
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from now!

Jose Hackler:

This Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies is new way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information because it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more
you know or else you who still having little digest in reading this Dreams and Visions in Islamic Societies
can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get by anyone.
These books develop itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book form. People
who think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this reserve is the answer. So you
cannot find any in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for a person. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book type for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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