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Lawrence Raab's richest work to date-his saddest, funniest, most personal, and most searching book

Of Lawrence Raab 's 1972 debut, Mark Strand wrote:

"This is a first book with more authority and wisdom in it than most poets are able to manage in their entire
careers. I am amazed by its casualness and clarity, its forcefulness, its engrossing strangeness." Mystery and
strangeness remain at the heart of Raab's work, but now they are revealed more fully through the world
around us-everyday deceptions, inexplicable violence, unexpected tenderness, the comedy of hope and
desire. In one poem, Proust appears in Raab's class to confront a student who disputes the great author's
claim that "the true paradises are the lost paradises." And in the title poem, set just before the Fall, the snake
alone understands how people will come to yearn "for whatever they'd lost, and so to survive/ they'd need to
forget."
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From reader reviews:

Amanda Bell:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who
don't like looking at a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you'll have this The History of Forgetting (Penguin Poets).

Dennis Green:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know
that book is very important for people. The book The History of Forgetting (Penguin Poets) was making you
to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you.
The guide The History of Forgetting (Penguin Poets) is not only giving you considerably more new
information but also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your personal spend time
to read your publication. Try to make relationship while using book The History of Forgetting (Penguin
Poets). You never feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Haley Thacker:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity this is look different
you can read any book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day
every day to reading a publication. The book The History of Forgetting (Penguin Poets) it is extremely good
to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this
book. If you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore
effortlessly to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses
high quality.

Amanda Stone:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This guide The History of Forgetting (Penguin Poets) was filled concerning science. Spend
your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has diverse
feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a
publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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