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For nearly half a century Jared Carter has been quietly mapping the American heartland. Line by line, his
poetry has shown us the landscape, sounded the voices, conjured the music, and tested the silence of the
ever-changing and yet ever-constant Midwest that figures so prominently in the American story. And yet
what we find in Carter’s poetry is endlessly new.
 
Here, in poems selected from his first five books, is the summer-long buzz of the cicada and the crack of the
cue ball, the young rebel on his big Harley, and the YMCA secretary who backstrokes her way across the
indoor pool. Here, too, are thirty new poems in fixed form that illustrate Carter’s continued quest for a poetry
of “universal interest.” Taken together, these selections are, truly, poetry in the American grain.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Ellefson:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed
Darkened Rooms of Summer: New and Selected Poems (Ted Kooser Contemporary Poetry)? Maybe it is to
get best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book,
you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have different opinion?

Isaias McGee:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a information or any news even a concern. What people must be consider when those
information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you buy it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen within you if you take Darkened Rooms of Summer: New and Selected Poems
(Ted Kooser Contemporary Poetry) as your daily resource information.

Lee Long:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can easily
share their idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only situation that share in the ebooks. But also they write
about the ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their proficiency in writing, they also doing some study before they write with their book. One of them is this
Darkened Rooms of Summer: New and Selected Poems (Ted Kooser Contemporary Poetry).

Sean Ward:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
their friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic from the
park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book might be option to fill your no cost
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want
to consider look for book, may be the guide untitled Darkened Rooms of Summer: New and Selected Poems
(Ted Kooser Contemporary Poetry) can be very good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.
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